RESOLUTIONS TO BE MOVED BY THE
CHANCELLOR OF THE EXCHEQUER

15 MARCH 2023



(2)

The Chancellor of the Exchequer

PROVISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXES: That,
pursuant to section 5 of the Provisional
Collection of Taxes Act 1968, provisional
statutory effect shall be given to the following
motions:—
(a) Stamp duty land tax (transaction
funded with the assistance of a subsidy)
(motion no. 39);
(b)Fuel duties (excepted machines) (motion
no. 44);
(c)Rates of tobacco products duty (motion no.
46),
(d)Late payment interest (value added tax)
(motion no. 57);
(e) Charities (value added tax etc) (motion
no. 65).



(3)

ARRANGEMENT OF
WAYS AND MEANS RESOLUTIONS

1. Income tax (charge)

2. Income tax (main rates)

3. Income tax (default and savings rate)

a. Income tax (starting rate limit for savings)

s. Corporation tax (charge and main rate for
financial year 2024)

6. Corporation tax (standard small profits rate and
fraction for financial year 2024)

7. Capital allowances (temporary full expensing
etc)

s. Annual investment allowance

o. Capital allowances (electric vehicle charge
points)

10.Corporation tax relief (research and

development)



(4)

11.Corporation tax relief (profits from patents etc)

12.Energy (oil and gas) profits levy
(de-carbonisation allowance)

13. Museums and galleries exhibition tax relief
(extension of sunset date)

14.Creative reliefs (extension of period for
temporary increase in credits)

15.Seed enterprise investment scheme (amount on
which relief may be claimed etc)

1. Company share option plans

17. Enterprise management incentives

18.Pensions (lifetime allowance charge and annual
allowance)

19.Pensions (collective money purchase benefits)

20.Pensions (relief relating to net pay
arrangements)

21.50cial security payments

22.Qualifying care relief

23 Estates in administration and trusts

24.Basic life assurance and general annuity



()

business

2s.Insurers in difficulties

26.Corporate interest restriction

27.Investment vehicles

28.Share exchanges

20.Records relating to transfer pricing

s0.Double taxation relief (extended time limit
claims)

31.Chargeable gains (payments to farmers)

32.Chargeable gains (assessment periods)

33.Chargeable gains (separated spouses and civil
partners)

s4.Chargeable gains (election to treat gains as
accruing)

35.Chargeable gains (relief on disposal of joint
interests in land)

36.Alcohol duty

37. OECD Pillar Two

3s. Electricity generator levy

30.Stamp duty land tax (transaction funded with the



(6)

assistance of a subsidy)

s0.Value added tax (deposit schemes)

a1.Import duty (dumping, subsidisation and
safeguarding remedies)

a2.Import duty (rulings as to methods of valuation of
goods)

s3.Import duty (discharging goods from free
circulation procedure)

a4.Fuel duties (excepted machines)

s5.Fuel duties (definition of “HO%” and “BD%”")

6. Rates of tobacco products duty

47.S0ft drinks industry levy (flavour concentrates)
a8.Alr passenger duty (bands and rates)

0. Rates of vehicle excise duty

s0. HGV road user levy

s1. Rates of landfill tax

s2.Rates of climate change levy (future years)
s3.Rate of plastic packaging tax

s¢. Aggregates levy (exemptions and exploitation)

ss. Freeports and investment zones



(7)

s6. Rights to repayment of income tax

s7.Late payment interest (value added tax)

ss. Penalties (value added tax)

s0. VAT credits (repayment interest due where
evidence not provided)

s0.INSurance premium tax (notifications)

s1. Plastic packaging tax (penalties for late
payments)

s2.Management of customs and excise (approval of
aerodromes)

s3.Management of customs and excise (temporary
approvals)

s4.Licensing authorities (requirements to give or
obtain tax information)

es.Charities (value added tax etc)

ss. Charities (stamp duty)

s7.Charities (other taxes)

ss. Community amateur sports clubs

so.Homes for Ukraine Sponsorship scheme

70.Office of Tax Simplification



(8)
71.Dormant assets scheme
72.International arrangements for exchanging
iInformation
73.Payment of unclaimed money in court into the
Consolidated Fund
74.FInancial sanctions regulations

7s.Incidental or consequential provision



(9)

1. Income tax (charge)

That income tax is charged for the tax year
2023-24.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

2. Income tax (main rates)

That for the tax year 2023-24 the main rates of
Income tax are as follows—

@ the basic rate is 20%,

®» the higher rate is 40%, and

© the additional rate is 45%.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the

public interest that this Resolution should have



(10)
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

3. Income tax (default and savings rate)
That—

@ For the tax year 2023-24 the default rates of

Income tax are as follows—
@ the default basic rate is 20%,
® the default higher rate is 40%, and

o the default additional rate is 45%.

@ For the tax year 2023-24 the savings rates of

Income tax are as follows—
@ the savings basic rate is 20%,
® the savings higher rate is 40%, and

© the savings additional rate is 45%.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.



(11)

s Income tax (starting rate limit for savings)
That—

@ For the tax year 2023-24 the amount
specified in section 12(3) of the Income Tax
Act 2007 (the starting rate limit for savings)
Is “£5,000".

@ Accordingly, section 21 of that Act
(indexation) does not apply in relation to the
starting rate limit for savings for that tax

year.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

s.  Corporation tax (charge and main rate for

financial year 2024)



(12)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made—

@ for corporation tax to be charged for the
financial year 2024, and

® for the main rate of corporation tax for
that year to be 25%.

6. Corporation tax (standard small profits rate

and fraction for financial year 2024)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made—

@ for the standard small profits rate to be
19% for the purposes of Part 3A of the
Corporation Tax Act 2010 for the



(13)
financial year 2024, and
® for the standard marginal relief fraction

to be 3/200ths for those purposes for
that year.

7. Capital allowances (temporary full expensing

etc)

That provision may be made for temporary
first-year allowances under Part 2 of the Capital
Allowances Act 2001 in respect of expenditure
Incurred on plant or machinery by companies

within the charge to corporation tax.

s.  Annual investment allowance

That provision may be made for the maximum
amount of the annual investment allowance
under section 51A of the Capital Allowances Act
2001 to be £1,000,000 in relation to expenditure
Incurred on or after 1 April 2023.



(14)
o. Capital allowances (electric vehicle charge

points)

That provision may be made substituting the
year 2025 for the year 2023 specified in section
45EA(3)(a) and (b) of the Capital Allowances
Act 2001.

10. Corporation tax relief (research and

development)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made in relation to the
corporation tax relief contained in Chapter 6A of
Part 3 of the Corporation Tax Act 2009 or Part
13 of that Act—

@ conferring relief in respect of
expenditure on data and cloud

computing services,



(15)

© about the administration and
management of claims for the relief,

© about the circumstances in which an
enterprise counts as a small or
medium-sized enterprise and in which
accounts are to be treated as prepared
on a going concern basis, and

@ limiting relief for expenditure incurred
on payments to expenditure incurred on
payments made before the making of a

claim for the relief.

1. Corporation tax relief (profits from patents etc)

That provision may be made for substituting
references in section 357A(3) of the
Corporation Tax Act 2010 to the main rate of
corporation tax with references to whichever of
the main rate of corporation tax and the
standard small profits rate is charged on a

company’s profits which are not ring fence



(16)
profits.

2. Energy (oil and gas) profits levy

(de-carbonisation allowance)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made for relief from
energy (oil and gas) profits levy in respect of
capital expenditure incurred by a company on
the de-carbonisation of its upstream petroleum

production.

13.  Museums and galleries exhibition tax relief

(extension of sunset date)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made amending section
1218ZCG(1)(c) of the Corporation Tax Act 2009
by replacing the reference to the year 2024

with a reference to the year 2026.



(17)

12, Creative reliefs (extension of period for

temporary increase in  credits)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made amending sections 17,
19 and 21 of the Finance Act 2022 so as to
extend the periods for which the temporary

Increases in the credits have effect.

15. Seed enterprise investment scheme
(amount on which relief may be claimed etc)
That provision may be made—

@ Increasing to £200,000 the amount on
which relief may be claimed under Part
5A of the Income Tax Act 2007 or
Schedule 5BB to the Taxation of
Chargeable Gains Act 1992, and

® amending sections 257DI, 257DL and



(18)
257HF of the Income Tax Act 2007.

16. Company share option plans

That—

@ Schedule 4 to the Income Tax (Earnings
and Pensions) Act 2003 (CSOP schemes)

IS amended as follows.

@ In paragraph 6 (limit on value of shares
subject to options)—
@ In sub-paragraph (1), in the words after
paragraph (b), for “£30,000” substitute
“£60,000”, and

w after sub-paragraph (4) insert—

“(5) The Treasury may by regulations
amend  sub-paragraph (1) by
substituting a different sum of money
for the sum for the time being

specified there.”

@ In paragraph 15 (requirements relating to



(19)
shares that may be subject to share
options: introduction), in sub-paragraph
(1)—
@ after the entry for paragraph 17 insert “,
and”;
® omit the entry for paragraph 20 and the “,

and” before it.

@ Omit paragraph 20 (requirements as to other

shareholdings).

s In paragraph 27 (requirement about share
options granted in exchange), in sub-
paragraph (4)(a), for “20” substitute “18".

© The amendments made by paragraph (2)
have effect for the purposes of determining
whether a share option may be granted to
an individual on or after 6 April 2023 (“the

commencement day”).

@ The amendments made by paragraphs (3)

and (4) have effect in relation to—



(8)

9)

(10)

(20)
@ Share options granted on or after the
commencement day, and
» Shares acquired by the exercise of
share options on or after the
commencement day (regardless of
when those share options were

granted).

The amendment made by paragraph (5)
has effect in relation to share options
granted on or after the commencement

day.

A CSOP scheme which was approved by,
or notified to, His Majesty’s Revenue and
Customs before the commencement day
has effect on and after the commencement
day with any modifications needed to reflect

the amendments made by this Resolution.

In particular, such a CSOP scheme has

effect from the commencement day with—



(21)

@ the substitution of “£60,000” for
“£30,000” in any provision required by
paragraph 6 of Schedule 4 to the
Income Tax (Earnings and Pensions)
Act 2003;

» the omission of any provision that
(before the amendments made by this
Resolution) was required by paragraph
20 of that Schedule by virtue of
paragraph 15(1) of that Schedule.

ay In this Resolution, “CSOP scheme” and
“share option” have the same meaning as in
the CSOP code (see paragraph 37 of
Schedule 4 to the Income Tax (Earnings
and Pensions) Act 2003).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.



(22)
17. Enterprise management incentives

That—

o Schedule 5 to the Income Tax (Earnings
and Pensions) Act 2003 (enterprise
management incentives) is amended as

follows.

@ In Part5 (requirements relating to options),
In paragraph 37 (terms of option to be
agreed in writing) omit sub-paragraphs (4)
and (5).

e In Part 7 (notification of option to HMRC), in

paragraph 44 (notice of option to be given
to HMRC)—

@ In sub-paragraph (5)—

o after paragraph (a) insert “and”;



(23)

@y omit paragraph (c) and the “, and”
iImmediately before it;

® omit sub-paragraphs (5A) and (6).

@ In Part 8 (supplementary provisions) omit
paragraph 57A (penalty for non-compliance
with paragraph 44(5A)).

s The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to—
@ Share options granted on or after 6 April
2023, or
» Share options granted before 6 April
2023 which are capable of being
exercised on or after that date (“relevant
options”).
© But if—

@ an employer company has granted

relevant options to persons by reason of



(24)
their employment with the company,

and

v the effect of paragraph (5)(b) would
otherwise be that a relevant requirement
would not be met in relation to one or
more share options granted before 6
April 2023,

the employer company must, on or before
the relevant day, make arrangements for
determining which of the relevant options, or
the extent to which those options, are to
take the benefit of paragraph (5)(b) without
a relevant requirement not being met in
relation to any share options granted before
6 April 2023.

» The arrangements must—

@ Set out the criteria by reference to
which the determination will be made,

and

» be made available to persons who may



(25)
be affected by the determination.

e If the employer company fails to make
arrangements in accordance with paragraph
(7) in a case where it is required to do so by
paragraph (6), which relevant options, or the
extent to which those options, take the
benefit of paragraph (5)(b) is to be
determined in the chronological order in
which those options were granted (and
where two or more relevant options were
granted at the same time, the extent to
which those options take the benefit of
paragraph (5)(b) is, where necessary, to be

apportioned between those options).

9 In this Resolution—
“relevant day” means 6 July following the
end of the first tax year in which a
relevant option granted by the employer
company is exercised,

“relevant options” has the meaning given



(26)

iIn paragraph (5)(b);

“relevant requirement” means any of the

requirements in paragraphs
5(1), 6(2) or (4) or 7(1) of Schedule 5 to the
Income Tax (Earnings and
Pensions) Act 2003;

“share option” and “employer company”
have the same meaning as in the EMI
code (see paragraph 59 of Schedule 5
to the Income Tax (Earnings and

Pensions) Act 2003).



(27)

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

1s. Pensions (lifetime allowance charge
and annual allowance)
That provision may be made—
@ abolishing the lifetime allowance charge,
®» Increasing the amount of the annual
allowance in section 228 of the Finance
Act 2004 to £60,000,
© replacing references to £240,000 with
references to £260,000 in section
228ZA(1) and (3)(a) and (b) of that
Act,
@ replacing references to £4,000 with

references to £10,000 in sections



(28)
227ZA to 228ZA of that Act, and
@ amending provisions that confer
transitional protection in connection
with—
o the introduction of the lifetime
allowance charge, or
@y reductions subsequently made in
the amount of the lifetime

allowance.

19. Pensions (collective money purchase benefits)

That provision may be made about the
treatment under Part 4 of the Finance Act 2004

of collective money purchase benefits.

2. Pensions (relief relating to net pay

arrangements)

That provision may be made about net pay

arrangements for pensions in cases where



(29)

there is no liability to income tax.

21 Social security payments

That provision (including provision having

retrospective effect) may be made—

@ exempting from income tax payments

(b)

made by way of training allowance
under the Jobs Growth Wales Plus
scheme, and

conferring a power on the Treasury to
charge to income tax certain social
security benefits payable by virtue of an
Act of the Scottish Parliament, an Act of
Senedd Cymru or Northern Ireland

legislation.

2. Qualifying care relief

That provision may be made in relation to the

amounts specified in sections 808(2) and
811(1A) and (2)(a) and (b) of the Income Tax



(30)
(Trading and Other Income) Act 2005.

23, Estates in administration and trusts

That—

@ provision, Including provision that
(notwithstanding anything to the contrary in
the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
takes effect in a future year, may be made
amending Chapter 6 of Part 5 of the Income
Tax (Trading and Other Income) Act 2005
and Chapter 3 of Part 10 of the Corporation
Tax Act 2009,

® provision may be made (notwithstanding
anything to the contrary in the practice of the
House relating to the matters that may be
Included in Finance Bills) taking effect in a

future year amending Chapter 3 of 3 of Part 2



©

(31)

of the Income Tax Act 2007 in cases where
the net income of personal representatives or
trustees does not exceed a specified amount,
and

provision may be made (notwithstanding
anything to the contrary in the practice of the
House relating to the matters that may be
Included in Finance Bills) taking effect in a
future year omitting Chapter 6 of Part 9 of
that Act.



(32)

24. Basic life assurance and general annuity

business

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made in relation to
re-insurance involving insurance companies
carrying on basic life assurance and general

annuity business.

5. Insurers in difficulties

That provision may be made about the
consequences of a court making an order

writing down the liabilities of an insurer.

6. Corporate interest restriction

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made—
@ about the rules relating to corporate

interest restriction contained in Part 10



(33)
of the Taxation (International and Other
Provisions) Act 2010 (including by
amending that Part) and the effect of
predecessor provisions, and

» amending section 457 of the Corporation
Tax Act 20009.

27. Investment vehicles

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made—
@ amending Schedule 5AAA to the
Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act 1992
(UK property rich collective investment
vehicles etc) to alter the way the
genuine diversity of ownership test
applies,
© amending Part 12 of the Corporation
Tax Act 2010 (Real Estate Investment
Trusts) to alter the way that test applies

and alter other tests relevant to the



(34)
application of that Part,

© amending Schedule 2 to the Finance
Act 2022 (qualifying asset holding
companies) to alter the way the
genuine diversity of ownership test
applies and to make minor and
technical changes to that Schedule,
and

@ amending the Real Estate Investment
Trusts (Assessment and Recovery of
Tax) Regulations 2006 to make
changes to the extent to which
distributions to partnerships may be

paid without deduction of tax.

28.  Share exchanges

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made for assets
and income to be treated as being in the United

Kingdom for the purposes of capital gains tax



(35)
and income tax in cases involving the exchange

of shares or debentures In companies

iIncorporated outside the United Kingdom.

20. Records relating to transfer pricing

That provision may be made about the
keeping of records for the purposes of Part 4 of
the Taxation (International and Other
Provisions) Act 2010.

.  Double taxation relief (extended time limit

claims)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made about claims
under section 79 of the Taxation (International
and Other Provisions) Act 2010, or section
806(2) of the Income and Corporation Taxes
Act 1988, for a credit calculated by reference to

a foreign nominal rate of tax.



(36)
3. Chargeable gains (payments to farmers)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made about
payments under—
@ the Agriculture (Lump Sum Payment)
(England) Regulations 2022, or
» Regulation (EU) No 1307/2013 of the
European Parliament and of the
Council of 17 December 2013
establishing rules for direct payments
to farmers under support schemes
within the framework of the common
agricultural policy and repealing Council
Regulation (EC) No 637/2008 and
Council Regulation (EC) No 73/20009.

. Chargeable gains (assessment periods)

That provision may be made about the

application of section 28 of the Taxation of



(37)
Chargeable Gains Act 1992 for the purposes of

the Taxes Management Act 1970 and Schedule
18 to the Finance Act 1998.

;3. Chargeable gains (separated spouses and civil

partners)

That—

@  The Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act

1992 is amended as follows.

@ In section 58 (spouses and civil

partnerships), for subsection (1) substitute—

“(1A) If an individual (“A”) disposes of an
asset to another individual (“B”) in
circumstances where any of

subsections (1B) to (1D) applies, A and



(38)

B are to be treated as if B acquired the
asset from A for a consideration of such
amount as would secure that on the
disposal neither a gain nor a loss would

accrue to A.

(1B)  This subsection applies where the
disposal is made while Aand B—
@ are married to, or are civil partners
of, each other, and

® are living together.

(1C)  This subsection applies where the
disposal is made—
@ While A and B are married to, or are
civil partners of, each other,

o at atime when A and B have ceased

to live together, and

o before the earlier of—



(1D)

(39)

o the last day of the third tax year

(ii)

after the tax year in which A
and B ceased to live together,

or

the day on which a court grants
an order or decree for A and
B’s divorce, the annulment of
their marriage, the dissolution
or annulment of their civil
partnership, their judicial
separation or, as the case may
be, their separation In
accordance with a separation

order.

This subsection applies where—

@ A and B have ceased to be, or are

In the process of ceasing to be,

married to, or civil partners of, each

other, and

» the disposal of the asset is in



(40)
accordance with an agreement or
order within subsection (2)(a) or (b)
of section 225B (disposals in

connection with divorce etc).”

@ In section 225B (disposals in connection with
divorce etc)—
@ In subsection (1)(b), after “to” insert
“someone other than”;
® In subsection (3), after “disposal to” insert

“someone other than”.
4 After section 225B Insert—

“225BA Deferred payments on disposals in

connection with divorce etc

@ This section applies where—
@ an individual (“A”) ceases to live
with A’s spouse or civil partner (“B”)
In a dwelling-house or part of a

dwelling house,

& Immediately before A ceases to live



(41)

with B, the dwelling-house or part is
A’s only or main residence,

© A disposes of, or of an interest in,
that dwelling-house or part to B
(“the initial disposal”), and

@ the initial disposal is in accordance
with a deferred sale agreement or

order.

@ If—
@ In accordance with the deferred
sale agreement or order A receives
a sum In respect of a share of any
profit made by B upon B’s disposal
of, or of an interest in, the dwelling-

house or part, and



(3)

(42)

© the receipt of that sum would be
treated (apart from this section) as
a disposal falling with section 22
(disposal where capital sums

derived from assets),

that receipt is to be treated for the
purposes of this Act as a gain
attributable to the initial disposal but
accruing to A at the time the sum is

received.

In this section, a “deferred sale
agreement or order” is an agreement or
order of a court which—

@ IS within paragraph (a) or (b), as
the case may be, of section
225B(2) (agreements and orders of
the court Iin relation to divorce etc),

and

® Includes a term entiting A to

receive a share of any profit made



(43)
by B as mentioned in subsection
(2)(a).”
) In Part 8 (supplemental), in section 288

(interpretation), in subsection (3), after

“partner” insert “(however expressed)”.

© The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to disposals made on
or after 6 April 2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

sa.  Chargeable gains (election to treat gains as

accruing)

That provision may be made for individuals to
elect for chargeable gains to be treated as
accruing in relation to arrangements described

In section 103KA of the Taxation of Chargeable



(44)
Gains Act 1992.

5. Chargeable gains (relief on disposal of joint

interests in land)

That provision may be made amending
sections 248A and 248E of the Taxation  of
Chargeable Gains Act 1992 in cases where the

land disposed of is held by a partnership.

3. Alcohol duty

That provision may be made for charging a
duty of excise on alcoholic products that are
produced in, or imported into, the United

Kingdom.

3. OECD Pillar Two
That provision may be made—
@ Imposing a tax for the purpose of
Implementing the OECD Pillar Two

model rules (Tax Challenges Arising



(45)
from Digitalisation of the Economy —
Global Anti-Base Erosion Model Rules)
so far as they relate to the charging of a
top-up tax under the income inclusion
rule (within the meaning of those rules),

and

® Imposing a tax for purposes in
connection with implementing a
Qualified Domestic Minimum Top-up

Tax within the meaning of those rules.

;8. Electricity generator levy

That provision may be made imposing a tax in
respect of receipts that relate to electricity
generated, or that was expected to be
generated, on or after 1 January 2023 and
before 1 April 2028, where those receipts reflect
a price per megawatt hour exceeding a

specified price.



(46)

30. Stamp duty land tax (transaction funded

with the assistance of a subsidy) That—

@ In section 71 of Finance Act 2003 (certain
acquisitions by registered social landlord),

after subsection (4) insert—

“(5) In this section “public subsidy” also
means any grant under section 31 of
the Local Government Act 2003 (grants
towards expenditure incurred or to be
iIncurred by local authorities) towards
expenditure incurred or to be incurred
on the provision of social housing
within the meaning of Part 2 of the
Housing and Regeneration Act 2008
(see sections 68 and 72 of that Act).”

@ The amendment made by this Resolution
has effect in relation to land transactions
the effective date of which falls on or after
15 March 2023.



(47)
And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have

statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

w. Value added tax (deposit schemes)

That provision may be made for the purposes
of value added tax where amounts are payable
In respect of goods in accordance with schemes
established under Schedule 8 to the
Environment Act 2021 or similar schemes

established under other legislation.

a1.  Import duty (dumping, subsidisation and
safeguarding remedies)
That, for the purposes of import duty,
provision may be made—
@ requiring the Trade Remedies Authority
to give the Secretary of State notice at

certain points in dumping, subsidisation



(b)

(©

(d)

(e)

(f)

(9)

(48)
and safeguarding investigations,
enabling the Authority to include more
than one option in recommendations to

the Secretary of State in relation to

such investigations,

authorising the Secretary of State to
ask for additional advice from, and to
act otherwise than in accordance with a
recommendation of, the Authority In

relation to such investigations,

requiring the Authority to advise the
Secretary of State on whether the
economic interest test is met in relation
to remedies that it recommends In
dumping, subsidisation or safeguarding
cases,

about reviews of the application of
remedies in such cases,

about bilateral safeguards, and

about Part 12 of the Trade Remedies



(49)
(Dumping and Subsidisation) (EU Exit)
Regulations 2019.

2. Import duty (rulings as to methods of valuation

of goods)

That provision may be made amending section
24 of the Taxation (Cross-border Trade) Act
2018.

3. Import duty (discharging goods from free

circulation procedure)

That provision may be made for the discharge
of goods from the free-circulation procedure
under the Taxation (Cross-border Trade) Act
2018 to be subject, in certain circumstances, to
a guarantee being given in respect of any
liability or potential liability to import duty in

respect of the goods.



(50)
a.  Fuel duties (excepted machines)

That—

@ Schedule 1A to the Hydrocarbon Oil Duties
Act 1979 (excepted machines able to use

rebated diesel etc) is amended as follows.

@ In paragraph 6 (vessels)—
@ In the heading, after “Vessels” insert
‘etc’;
w after sub-paragraph (3) insert—
“(4) A tractor or gear owned by a charity
and used by it for the purpose of
launching or hauling in a lifeboat

owned by it.”

@ In paragraph 8 (other machines or
appliances)—
@ In sub-paragraph (1)—
@ In paragraph (a), after “pisciculture”
Insert “, arboriculture”;

@y In paragraph (d), at the beginning



(51)
iInsert “primarily”;
iy 1N paragraph (e), for “of premises
that are used for commercial
purposes” substitute “for any
premises”;

w after sub-paragraph (2) insert—

“(3) The Commissioners may publish a
notice making provision for the
purposes of sub-paragraph (1)(d)
about the meaning of—

@ “primarily”, and

v “used for commercial purposes”.

@ This Resolution comes into force on 15 March
2023.



(52)

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

ss.  Fuel duties (definition of “HO%” and “BD%”)

That provision may be made amending the
definitions of “HO%" and “BD%” in section 14B
of the Hydrocarbon QOil Duties Act 1979.

s6. Rates of tobacco products duty
That—

@ In Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products
Duty Act 1979 (table of rates of tobacco
products duty), for the Table substitute—

“TABLE



(53)

1 Cigarettes

An amount equal to the

higher of—
@ 16.5% of the

retall price
plus £294.72
per thousand
cigarettes, or
v £393.45 per
thousand

cigarettes.

2 Cigars

£367.61 per kilogram




(54)

3 Hand-rolling £351.03 per kilogram

tobacco

4 Other smoking [£161.62 per kilogram
tobacco and

chewing tobacco

5 Tobacco for £302.93 per kilogram”

heating

@ In consequence of the provision made by
paragraph (1), in Schedule 2 to the
Travellers’ Allowances Order 1994 (which

provides in certain circumstances for a



(55)
simplified calculation of excise duty on

goods brought into Great Britain)—

@ In the entry relating to cigarettes, for
“£347.86” substitute “£393.45",

® In the entry relating to hand rolling
tobacco, for “£302.34” substitute
“£351.03",

© Inthe entry relating to other smoking
tobacco and chewing tobacco, for
“£144.17” substitute “£161.62”,

@ In the entry relating to cigars, for “£327.92"
substitute “£367.61”,

© In the entry relating to cigarillos, for
“£327.92” substitute “£367.61”, and

© In the entry relating to tobacco for
heating, for “£81.07” substitute
“£90.88".



(56)

@ The amendments made by this Resolution

come into force at 6pm on 15 March 2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

a7, Soft drinks industry levy (flavour concentrates)
That—

@ Part 2 of the Finance Act 2017 (soft drinks

iIndustry levy) is amended as follows.

@ Section 26 (“soft drink” and “package”) is

amended as follows—

@ at the end of subsection (1) insert *;

« a liquid flavouring (a “flavour
concentrate”) which, when

processed in a specified manner



(57)
In a dispensing machine,
constitutes a beverage within that
paragraph.”;
w after subsection (2) insert—

“(2A) A flavour concentrate is processed in a
specified manner if—
© Itis combined with added sugar
ingredients, with or without—
o artificial sweeteners, or
@ one or more other flavour
concentrates; and
@ the flavour concentrate (or
combination) is prepared in a

specified manner.

(2B) A “dispensing machine” is a machine
designed to—
@ combine, process or prepare
Ingredients so as to produce a

beverage, and



(58)
® supply the beverage directly to a

consumer.

(2C) In subsection (2A)(a), “added
sugar ingredients” means anything
within paragraph (a) or (b) of section
29(2).":
© In subsection (3)—
@ omit the “and” at the end of paragraph
(a);

@y after paragraph (b) insert “and

«© Inthe case of a soft drink within
subsection (1)(c)—

o it is suitable to be
consumed when processed

In a specified manner in a
dispensing machine (and
without any other
processing or preparation),

and



(59)
@y Itis ready foruseina

dispensing machine;”.

@ Section 27 (meaning of “prepared drink”) is

amended as follows—

@ at the end of subsection (1) insert *;

© a beverage that would result

from—



(60)

@ fprocessing a flavour
concentrate within subsection
(1)(c) of that section in a
specified manner In a
dispensing machine, and
@) In accordance with the
relevant dispensing
instructions.”;
® In subsection (2)(b), for “subsection (3)”
substitute “subsection (3)(@)”;

« after subsection (2) insert—

“(2A) The “relevant dispensing instructions”
means—

o the instructions for use of the
flavour concentrate provided with,
or for the purposes of use with, the
concentrate or a dispensing

machine with which it is designed



b)

(61)
to be used,
where subsection (3)(b) or (4A)
applies, the dispensing instructions

determined by the

Commissioners.”;

@ for subsection (3) substitute—

3

(@)

This subsection applies where—

In a case within subsection (1)(b),
the packaging of the soft drink
states neither the dilution ratio nor
iInformation by reference to which
the dilution ratio can be
calculated,;

In a case within subsection (1)(c),
no dispensing instructions are
provided with, or for the purposes
of use with, the flavour concentrate
or with any dispensing machine
with which it Is designed to be

used.”;



(62)
@ after subsection (4) insert—

“(4A) This subsection applies where—
@ dispensing instructions are provided,
and
®) It IS reasonable to assume that the
main purpose, or one of the main
purposes, of providing those
particular dispensing instructions is
avoiding or reducing liability for
soft drinks industry levy.”;
@ In subsection (5)—

o after paragraph (a) insert—

“(aa) determining dispensing
Instructions for the purposes of
subsection (2A)(b);”;

@y for paragraph (b) substitute—

“(b) determining whether the main
purpose, or one of the main

purposes, of—



(63)
@ stating a particular dilution
ratio or information, or
@y providing particular dispensing
instructions;
IS avoiding or reducing liability

for soft drinks industry levy.”

@ In section 29 (sugar content condition), in
subsection (1)—
@ In the words before paragraph (a), omit “it
contains”;

w for paragraph (a) (but not the “and” at the
end) substitute—



(64)

“(@) either—
o It is a soft drink within section
26(1)(c), or
@y It contains added sugar
ingredients;”;
«© atthe beginning of paragraph (b) insert “it

contains”.

s In section 30 (exempt soft drinks), in

subsection (1)—
@ omit the “and” at the end of paragraph
(©);
w after paragraph (d) insert “, and
(e)soft drinks within section
26(1)(c) (flavour concentrates)

that meet such conditions as may

be specified.”

@ After section 36 (levy rates) insert—



(65)
“36A Determining levy rate for flavour

concentrates

@ This section applies where—

o two or more flavour concentrates
are formulated so as to be
combined with one another Iin a
dispensing machine (see section
26(2A)(a)(ii)), and

v each of those flavour concentrates is a

chargeable soft drink.

@ The references in section 36(1) to a litre
of prepared drink are treated, in relation
to each of the flavour concentrates, as
references to the relevant proportion of

a litre of prepared drink.

3 Subject to subsection (4), the “relevant

proportion” is—

-



(66)
N

where N is the number of flavour
concentrates that are designed to be

combined.

@ The Commissioners may by regulations
make provision for determining the
relevant proportion (otherwise than in
accordance with subsection (3)) In
cases where the flavour concentrates
mentioned in subsection (1)(@) are
formulated so as to be combined in a
dispensing machine—

@ In unequal proportions, or
o In different combinations for different

beverages.”

@ Section 39 (tax credits) is amended as

follows—

@ In subsection (1), after paragraph (b) insert



(67)
© In the case of soft drinks within

section 26(1)(c), the flavour

concentrate—

o has not been combined with
added sugar ingredients (but
has been prepared Iin a
specified manner), or

iy has been processed in a
specified manner so as to
result in a beverage that
contains less than 5 grams of
sugars per 100 millilitres of

prepared drink.”;

® In subsection (2)(a) for “exported or (as
the case may be) lost or destroyed”
substitute “that fall within subsection

(1)(a), (b) or (c) (as the case may be)”.

® The amendments made by this Resolution



(68)
come into force on 1 April 2023 in relation
to soft drinks that are packaged in, or

Imported into, the United Kingdom on or

after that date.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

s, Alir passenger duty (bands and rates)

That—

Air passenger duty from 1 April 2023:

bands and rates

@ Section 30 of the Finance Act 1994 (air
passenger duty: rates) is amended as

follows.

@ In subsection (1A), after “long haul” insert “and

ultra-long haul”.



(69)
3 After subsection (1A) insert—

“(1B) If the passenger’s journey ends at a
place in the United Kingdom—

@ If the passenger's agreement for
carriage provides for standard
class travel in relation to every
flight on the passenger’s journey,
the rate is £6.50, and

® In any other case, the rateis £13.”

@ In subsection (2) omit “the United Kingdom

or”.
s) After subsection (2) insert—

“(2A) If the passenger’s journey ends at
a place in a territory specified in Part
1A of Schedule 5A—

@ If the passenger's agreement for
carriage provides for standard
class travel in relation to every

flight on the passenger’s journey,



(70)
the rate is £87, and

® In any other case, the rateis £191.”

© In subsection (4A)—
@ In paragraph (a), for “£84” substitute
“£917;
® In paragraph (b), for “£185” substitute
“£200".

@ In subsection (4E)—
@ before paragraph (a) insert—
“(za) if the rate which (apart from this
subsection) would apply is the
rate in subsection (1B)(a) or (b),
a rate of £78 is to apply instead,”;
© In paragraph (a), for “equal to six times
the rate in subsection (2)(a)” substitute
“of £787;

© omit the “and” at the end of paragraph (a);

@ after paragraph (a) insert—

“(aa) if the rate which (apart from this



(71)
subsection) would apply is the
rate in subsection (2A)(a) or (b), a
rate of £574 is to apply instead,
and”;
@ In paragraph (d), for “equal to 6.6 times
the rate in subsection (4A)(a)” substitute
“of £601".

® In Schedule 5A to the Finance Act 1994 (air

passenger duty: territories etc)—
@ in Part1 (Partl territories)—

@ for “Czech Republic” substitute

“Czechia”;

@iy for “Former Yugoslav Republic of”
substitute “North”;

v after Part 1 insert—

“PART 1A

PART 1A
TERRITORIES

Afghanistan  Cuba



(72)
Kyrgyzstan Senegal

Angola Curacao

Lebanon  Seychelles

Anguilla  Djibouti

Liberia Sierra Leone

Antigua and Barbuda
Dominica Macau Sint

Eustatius

Armenia Dominican
Republic Malawi Sint

Maarten

Aruba Egypt Maldives

Somalia

Azerbaijan El Salvador
Mali South Korea

Bahrain  Equatorial
Guinea Martinique
South Sudan



(73)
Bangladesh  Eritrea

Mauritania Sri Lanka

Barbados Ethiopia
Mayotte St Helena,
Ascension and Tristan da
Cunha

Belize French Guiana
Mongolia St Kitts and

Nevis

Benin Gabon

Montserrat Sudan

Bermuda Georgia

Namibia Suriname

Bhutan Ghana Nepal
Syria

Bonaire Grenada

Nicaragua Tajikistan

Botswana Guadeloupe



(74)

Niger Tanzania

Brazil Guatemala

Nigeria The Bahamas

British Virgin Islands
Guinea North KoreaThe

Gambia

Burkina Faso Guinea-

Bissau Oman Togo

Burundi  Guyana
Pakistan  Trinidad and

Tobago

Cameroon Haiti
Panama

Turkmenistan

Canada  Honduras
Qatar Turks and

Caicos Islands

Cape Verde India



(75)
Russian Federation, east

of the Ural Mountains

Uganda

Cayman Islands  Iran
Rwanda  United Arab

Emirates

Central African Republic
lragSaba United
States (including Puerto
Rico and U.S. Virgin

Islands)

Chad Israel Saint

Barthélemy Uzbekistan

China Ivory Coast

Saint Lucia Venezuela

Colombia Jamaica

Saint MartinYemen

Comoros Jordan



(76)
Saint Pierre and

Miquelon Zambia

Congo Kazakhstan
Saint Vincent and the

Grenadines Zimbabwe”.

Congo (Demaocratic
Republic) Kenya Sao

Tome and Principe

Costa Rica Kuwait
Saudi Arabia

Air passenger duty from 1 April 2023:

Northern Ireland rates

@ Section 30A of the Finance Act 1994
(Northern Ireland long haul rates of duty) is

amended as follows.

ao) In the heading, after “long haul” insert “and



(77)
ultra-long haul”.

a1 In subsection (5A), in paragraph (c) omit

sub-paragraph (i) and the “or” before it.

az) After subsection (7) insert—

“(7A) For the purposes of any paragraph, an
Act of the Northern Ireland Assembly may set
one rate for cases within section 30(2A) and a

different rate for cases within section 30(4A).”

Commencement

a3 The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to the carriage of
passengers beginning on or after 1 April
2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.



(78)
2. Rates of vehicle excise duty

That—

o Schedule 1 to the Vehicle Excise and
Registration Act 1994 (annual rates of

vehicle excise duty) is amended as follows.

@ In paragraph 1 (general rate)—

@ In  sub-paragraph (2) (vehicle not
covered elsewhere in Schedule with
engine cylinder capacity exceeding
1,549cc), for “£295" substitute “£325”,
and

® In sub-paragraph (2A) (vehicle not
covered elsewhere in Schedule with
engine cylinder capacity not exceeding
1,549cc), for “£180” substitute “£200".

@ In paragraph 1B (graduated rates for light
passenger vehicles registered before 1 April
2017), for the Table substitute—



(79)

“CO2 Emissions Figure Rate
(1) (2) (3) (4)
Exceeding Not Reduced| Standard

exceeding rate Rate

g/km g/km £ £
100 110 10 20
110 120 25 35
120 130 140 150
130 140 170 180
140 150 190 200
150 165 230 240
165 175 280 290




(80)

“C0O2 Emissions Figure Rate
175 185 310 320
185 200 355 365
200 225 385 395
225 255 665 675
255 — 685 695",

@ In the sentence immediately following the
Table in that paragraph, for paragraphs (a)
and (b) substitute—

“(@) In column (3), in the last two
rows, “385” were substituted for
“665” and “685”, and

(b)in column (4), in the last two

rows, “395” were substituted for
“675” and “695”.”

s In paragraph 1GC (graduated rates for first
licence for light passenger vehicles

registered on or after 1 April 2017), for Table




(81)

1 (vehicles other than higher rate diesel
vehicles) substitute—
“C0O2 Emissions Figure Rate
(1) (2) (3) (4)
Exceeding Not Reduced| Standard
exceeding rate Rate
g/km g/km £ £
0 50 0 10
50 75 20 30
75 90 120 130
90 100 155 165
100 110 175 185
110 130 200 210
130 150 245 255
150 170 635 645
170 190 1030 1040
190 225 1555 1565




(82)

“CO2 Emissions Figure Rate
225 255 2210 2220
255 — 2595 2605".

e In that paragraph, for Table 2 (higher rate diesel

vehicles)

substitute—

“CO2 Emissions Figure Rate
(1) (2) (3)
Exceeding Not Rate
exceeding
g/km ag/km £
0 50 30
50 75 130
75 90 165
90 100 185
100 110 210
110 130 255
130 150 645
150 170 1040




(83)

170 190 1565
190 225 2220
225 255 2605
255 — 2605".

U

©

In paragraph 1GD(1) (rates for any other
licence for light passenger vehicles registered
on or after 1 April 2017)—
@ In paragraph (a) (reduced rate), for “£155”
substitute “£170”, and
® In paragraph (b) (standard rate), for “£165”
substitute “£180".

In paragraph 1GE(2) (rates for light
passenger vehicles registered on or after 1
April 2017 with a price exceeding
£40,000)—
@ In paragraph (a), for “£510” substitute
“£560”, and
® In paragraph (b), for “£520” substitute
“£570".

o In paragraph 1J(a) (rates for light goods




(84)
vehicles that are not pre-2007 or post-2008

lower emission vans), for “£290” substitute
“£320".

aw In paragraph 2(1) (rates for motorcycles)—

@ In paragraph (a) (engine cylinder
capacity not exceeding 150cc), for “£22”
substitute “£24”,

® In paragraph (b) (motorbicycles with
engine cylinder capacity exceeding
150cc but not exceeding 400cc), for
“E47" substitute  “£527,

© In paragraph (c) (motorbicycles with
engine cylinder capacity exceeding
400cc but not exceeding 600cc), for
“£73” substitute “£80”, and

@ In paragraph (d) (other cases), for “£101”
substitute “£111".

a The amendments made by this Resolution

have effect in relation to licences taken out



(85)
on or after 1 April 2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

so. HGV road user levy

That—

Amendments to the HGV Road User
Levy Act 2013

@ The HGV Road User Levy Act 2013 is

amended as follows.

@ In section 1(1) (charge to HGV road user
levy), for the words “any heavy goods

vehicle” to the end substitute “—

@ any UK heavy goods vehicle that
IS used or kept on a road to which

this Act applies by virtue of section



(86)
3(1A)(a), and

® any non-UK heavy goods vehicle

that is used on a road to which this
Act applies by virtue of section
3(1A)(b).”

@ Section 3 (roads to which Act applies) is

amended as follows—

@ for subsection (1) substitute—

“(1A) Subject to subsection (2), this Act

applies—

@ In relation to UK heavy goods

®

vehicles, to all public roads in the
United Kingdom, and

In relation to non-UK heavy goods
vehicles, to any road which, under
the system for assigning
identification numbers to roads
administered by the Secretary of

State, Northern Ireland Ministers,



(87)
Scottish  Ministers or Welsh

Ministers, has been assigned a

number prefixed by Aor M.,

®» In subsection (2), in the words before
paragraph (a), after “may by order
provide” insert “in respect of UK heavy
goods vehicles or non-UK heavy goods
vehicles (or both)”;

© In subsection (4), for “this section”

substitute “subsection (1A)(a)”.

@ In section 5(7) (payment of levy for UK
heavy goods vehicles) for “paragraphs 2 to 4
of that Schedule and Tables 2 to 5’
substitute “paragraph 1(3) of that Schedule
and Table 1B”.



(88)

s) Section 6 (payment of levy for non-UK
heavy goods vehicles) is amended as
follows—

@ In subsection (2)—
@ omit “or kept”;
@y after “this Act applies” insert “by virtue
of section 3(1A)(b)";
® In subsection (9) for “paragraphs 2 to 4
of that Schedule and Tables 21to5”
substitute “paragraph 1(3) of that
Schedule and Table 1B”.

© In section 7(2) (rebate of levy), for paragraph

(c) substitute—

“(c) the person who paid the levy
notifies the Secretary of State
that—

@ In the case of a UK heavy



(i)

(89)

goods vehicle, the vehicle is
not intended to be used or
kept on a road to which this
Act applies by virtue of section
3(1A)(a) at any time during the
rest of the levy period, or

In the case of a non-UK heavy
goods vehicle, the vehicle is
not intended to be used on a
road to which this Act applies
by virtue of section 3(1A)(b) at
any time during the rest of the

levy period.”

@ In section 11 (offence of using or keeping

heavy goods vehicle if levy not paid), in

subsection (1), for the words before

paragraph (a)

substitute—

“If a person uses or keeps a UK heavy

goods vehicle on a road to which this

Act applies by virtue of section 3(1A)(a),



(90)
or uses a non-UK heavy goods vehicle
on a road to which this Act applies by
virtue of section 3(1A)(b), on a day in
respect of which the HGV road user
levy charged in respect of the vehicle

has not been paid—"

® Section 14 (register of levy paid or due to be

paid) is amended as follows—

@ In subsection (1), for “must” substitute

may’,

w after subsection (1) insert—

“(1A) Subsections (2) to (5) apply In
relation to any register set up and
kept under subsection (1).”;

© In subsection (4), at the end insert “but

need not be accessible to all members

of the public”.

9 In section 19 (interpretation), in subsection

(1), in the definition of “revenue weight”, at



(10)

(11)

(12)

(13)

(91)
the end insert “, subject to paragraph 5(2)
of Schedule 1”.

Schedule 1 (rates of HGV road user levy) is

amended as follows.

In paragraph 1, for sub-paragraph (3)

substitute—

“(3) Table 1B sets out the Bands for the
purposes of Tables 1 and 1A (and
those Bands depend on the revenue

weight of the vehicle).”
Omit paragraphs 2 to 4.
In paragraph 5—
@ the existing text becomes sub-paragraph

(1);

® In that sub-paragraph, in paragraph (a)—



(92)

@ omit “axle”, ”:
@ omit “and “tractive unit” each”;

« after that sub-paragraph insert—

“(2) For the purposes of this Schedule—

@ In calculating the revenue weight
of a rigid goods vehicle drawing a
trailer weighing less than 4,000
kilograms, the weight of the trailer
IS to be ignored,;

®» In calculating the revenue weight
of a rigid goods vehicle drawing a
trailer weighing 4,000 kilograms
or more, the weight of the trailer
IS to be added to the revenue

weight of the vehicle.”

a4a) For Table 1 substitute—

“TABLE 1: VEHICLES MEETING EURO 6



(93)

EMISSIONS STANDARDS — RATES FOR

EACH BAND
Band Daily |[Weekly [Monthly |Half- |Yearly
rate rate rate yearly |rate
rate
A £3.00 [(£7.50 £15.00 |£90.0 |£150.00
0
B £7.20 |£18.00 |£36.00 |[£216. |£360.00
00
C £9.00 |£28.80 |£57.60 |£345. |£576.00".
60




(94)
as) For Table 1A substitute—

“TABLE 1A: VEHICLES NOT MEETING EURO
6 EMISSIONS STANDARDS
— RATES FOR EACH BAND

Band |Daily rate |Weekly |Monthly |Half- |Yearly
rate rate yearly |rate

rate

A £3.90 £9.75 £19.50 |£117. |£195.00
00

B £9.36 £23.40 £46.80 |£280. [£468.00
80

C £10.00 £37.45 £74.90 |£449. |£749.00".
40

ae) After Table 1A insert—




(95)
“TABLE 1B: BANDS FOR THE PURPOSES
OF TABLES 1 AND 1A

Revenue weight of vehicle Band
More than 11,999kgs but not |A

more than 31,000kgs
More than 31,000kgs but not |B
more than 38,000kgs

More than 38,000kgs C”.

an Omit Tables 2 to 5.

Transitional provision for end of exempt period

as) In section 88 of the Finance Act 2020 (HGV
road user levy)—
@ In the heading, at the end insert . exempt
period”;
® In subsection (1), atthe beginning insert
“Subject to section 88A,”;

© In subsection (3), at the beginning insert



(96)
“For the purposes of this section and

section 88A,”".
a9y After that section insert—

“88A HGV road user levy: transitional

provision for end of exempt period

@ This section applies where—

@ a UK heavy goods vehicle (the
“charged vehicle”) is charged to
vehicle excise duty in respect of
more than one period (a “charged
period”) beginning within the last 12
months of the exempt period, and

o the combined length of the charged

periods is more than 12 months.

@ Section 5(2) of the 2013 Act applies in
relation to the charged vehicle in
respect of each complete month in the
period (the  “transitional liability

period”)—



(97)

@ beginning with the day after the last
exempt day in relation to the
charged vehicle, and

o ending with the end of the charged
period during which that Ilast

exempt day occurs.

® The last exempt day, in relation to a
charged vehicle, is the last day of the
period of 12 months beginning with the
day on which the first charged period
beginning within the last 12 months of

the exempt period began.

@ Subsection (5) applies where, in relation to
the charged vehicle—

@ a notification has been made under
section 7(2)(c) of the 2013 Act (an
“off-road notification”) in respect of a
period beginning within the last 12

months of the exempt period, and



()

(6)

(98)
o Vvehicle excise duty Is charged in
respect of a period beginning—
o after the day on which the off-

road notification is made, and

iy Within the last 12 months of the

exempt period.

In calculating the period of 12 months
mentioned in subsection (3) ignore the
number of whole months in the period
beginning with the day on which the off-
road notification is made and ending
with the first day of the period described
In subsection (4)(b).

The Secretary of State, and any person
who may exercise powers on behalf of
the Secretary of State under section 9
of the 2013 Act (collection of levy), may
(in addition to having the powers, duties

and liabilities mentioned in that section)



(99)
give a notice (a “payment notice”) to a

person liable for HGV road user levy in

respect of a transitional liability period.

@ A payment notice must state—

@ the amount of HGV road user levy
for which the person is liable in
respect of the transitional liability
period,

o how the amount is to be paid, and

© that payment must be made within
the period of 28 days beginning
with the day on which the notice is

given.

® The amount in subsection (7)(a) is given

by—

L xM

where—



(100)

L is the yearly rate of HGV road user
levy applicable in relation to the
vehicle on the first day of the

transitional liability period, and

M is the number of whole months during

the transitional liability period.

© In relation to the transitional liability
period—

@ a person commits an offence under
section 11 of the 2013 Act (offence
of using or keeping heavy goods
vehicle iIf levy not paid) only if the
person—

o has been given a payment notice,
and

@ has failed to make payment in
accordance with that notice,

and

o section 7(5A) of the Vehicle Excise



(101)
and Registration Act 1994 has

effect as if the reference to HGV
road user levy having been paid
were a reference to it having been
paid in accordance with a payment

notice.

ao) In this section “UK heavy goods vehicle”
has the same meaning as in the HGV
Road User Levy Act 2013 (see section
2 of that Act).”

Commencement

200 The amendments made by this Resolution

come into force on 1 August 2023.



(102)

And it is declared that it is expedient in the

public interest that this Resolution should have

statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

51.

Rates of landfill tax

That—

@

@

(©)

@

Section 42 of the Finance Act 1996 (amount

of landfill tax) is amended as follows.

In subsection (1)(a) (standard rate), for
“£98.60" substitute “£102.10".

In subsection (2) (reduced rate for certain
disposals), in the words after paragraph
(b)—
@ for “£98.60” substitute “£102.10”, and
o for “£3.15” substitute “£3.25".

The amendments made by this Resolution



(103)

have effect in relation to disposals made (or

treated as made) on or after 1 April  2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

s2.  Rates of climate change levy (future years)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made taking effect in a future

year amending the rates of climate change levy.

s3.  Rate of plastic packaging tax
That—

o In section 45(1) of the Finance Act 2021
(rate of plastic packaging tax), for “£200”
substitute “£210.82".



(104)

@ The amendment made by this Resolution
has effect In relation to packaging
components produced in, or imported into,
the United Kingdom on or after 1 April
2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

sa.  Aggregates levy (exemptions and
exploitation)

That provision may be made for the
purposes of aggregates levy—

@ for aggregate won by being removed
from the ground on the site of any or
any proposed structure, or the site of
any or any proposed infrastructure
relating to transportation or utilities, to

be exempt from tax, and



(105)

o about the exploitation of aggregate
which again becomes part of the site
from which it was won or which
becomes part of any other site
occupied by the same person as the

site from which it was won.

ss. Freeports and investment zones
That—

@ provision may be made amending section
113(2), (3) and (5) of the Finance Act 2021
(designation of freeport tax sites), and

o (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in
the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills),

provision may be made for substituting a later



(106)
date for the dates specified in section 61A of
the Finance Act 2003 and sections 450,
270BNA and 270BNB of the Capital
Allowances Act 2001 (provision relating to

freeports).



(107)

ss. Rights to repayment of income tax

That provision may be made preventing the
assignment of a right to repayment of income

tax.

s7. Late payment interest (value added tax)
That—

@ In the Finance Act 2009, Sections 101 and
102 (Value Added Tax) (Late Payment
Interest and Repayment Interest)
(Exceptions and Conseqguential
Amendments) Order 2022 (S.I. 2022/1298),
In Part 2 (exceptions), before article 2

iInsert—

“Exception from section 101 of the Finance

Act 2009 - late payment interest
1A—(1) Section 101 of the Finance Act



(108)

2009 (late payment interest on sums due
to HMRC) does not apply to annual

accounting scheme instalments.

@ In paragraph (1) “annual accounting
scheme instalment” means an amount
payable to HMRC by virtue of regulation
50(2)(a) of the VAT Regulations.”

@ In Part 2 of Schedule 53 to the Finance Act
2009 (late payment interest start date), after

paragraph 11 insert—

“WVAT due after excess payment or credit from
HMRC

11ZA (1) This paragraph applies to any
amount of value added tax which is
due and recoverable from a person by

virtue of—

@ section 73(9) of the Value Added

Tax Act 1994, in relation to an



(109)

amount assessed and notified to
the person under subsection (2)

of that section, or

© section 80C(1) of that Act.

@ The late payment interest start date in
respect of that amount is the date on
which HMRC paid or credited that

amount to the person.”

® Where, ignoring this paragraph, the Ilate
payment interest start date in respect of an
amount would, by virtue of paragraph 11ZA
of that Schedule (as inserted by paragraph
(2)), fall before 15 March 2023, the late
payment interest start date in respect of
that amount is instead 15 March 2023.

@ This Resolution comes into force on 15 March
2023.



(110)
And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have

statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

ss. Penalties (value added tax)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made about
penalties for failure to pay instalments of value
added tax payable under the annual accounting

scheme.

s0. VAT credits (repayment interest due where

evidence not provided)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made for
repayment interest to be payable in respect of
amounts of VAT credit where there IS a
failure to comply with a requirement imposed

under paragraph 4(1) of Schedule 11 to the



(111)
Value Added Tax Act 1994,

0. Insurance premium tax (notifications)

That provision may be made about
notifications made under regulations under Part
3 of the Finance Act 1994.

6. Plastic packaging tax (penalties for late

payments)

That provision may be made amending
Schedule 56 to the Finance Act 2009 in  the

case of plastic packaging tax.

s2.  Management of customs and excise (approval

of aerodromes)

That provision may be made for the
Commissioners for His Majesty’'s Revenue and
Customs to approve aerodromes for the

purposes of customs and excise legislation.



(112)

6. Management of customs and excise

(temporary approvals)

That provision may be made amending section
16B of the Finance Act 1994.

sa. Licensing authorities (requirements to give or

obtain tax information)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made requiring licensing
authorities in Scotland and Northern Ireland,
when licensing certain activities, to give or

obtain information relating to tax compliance.

es. Charities (value added tax etc)
That—

@ In Part 1 of Schedule 6 to the Finance Act



(113)
2010 (definition of “charity” etc), iIn

paragraph 2 (jurisdiction condition)—
@ In sub-paragraph (1) omit paragraph (b)
(and the “or” before it);

® omit sub-paragraphs (3) to (5).

@ The amendments made by this Resolution—
@ apply only to a body of persons or trust
that has not asserted its status as a

charity, and

®» apply only for the purposes of value
added tax, stamp duty land tax, stamp
duty reserve tax and annual tax on

enveloped dwellings.

@ The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect—
@ for the purposes of value added tax, in
relation to supplies made, and
acquisitions and importations taking

place, on or after 15 March 2023;



(114)
w for the purposes of stamp duty land tax,
In relation to any land transaction the

effective date of which is on or after 15
March 2023;

« for the purposes of stamp duty reserve
tax, in relation to any agreement to
transfer securities in respect of which
the relevant day (within the meaning of
section 87(2) of the Finance Act 1986)
IS or is after 15 March 2023;

« for the purposes of annual tax on
enveloped dwellings—

o for the chargeable period beginning
with 1 April 2022 so far as it falls
on or after 15 March 2023, and

o for subsequent chargeable periods.

@ Notwithstanding paragraph (3)(b), the
amendments made by this Resolution do
not have effect for the purposes of stamp

duty land tax in relation to a transaction if—



(115)

@ the transaction is effected in pursuance
of a contract entered into and
substantially performed before 15
March 2023, or

® the transaction—

o IS effected in pursuance of a

contract entered into before that

date, and

® IS not excluded for the purposes of

this paragraph.

) A transaction is excluded for the purposes of
paragraph (4)(b)(ii)) if—
@ there is any variation of the contract, or
assignment of rights under the

contract, on or after 15 March 2023,

®» the transaction is effected in
consequence of the exercise on or after
that date of any option, right of pre-

emption or similar right, or



(116)

© on or after that date there is an
assignment, subsale or other
transaction relating to the whole or part
of the subject-matter of the contract as
a result of which a person other than
the purchaser under the contract
becomes entitled to call for a

conveyance.

© An apportionment to different periods which

()

falls to be made as a result of paragraph
(3)(d)()) iIs to be made on a time basis
according to the respective length of the

periods.

For the purposes of this Resolution a body
of persons or trust has “asserted its status
as a charity” if—

@ Immediately before 15 March 2023 it
falls within the definition of “charity” in
Part 1 of Schedule 6 to the Finance
Act 2010, and



(117)

® at any time before that date, it has
(under any enactment) made a valid
claim to His Majesty’'s Revenue and
Customs in reliance on its status as a

charity.

® The amendments made by this Resolution
are to be ignored in determining whether a
person who, immediately before 15 March
2023, holds a relevant interest in—
@ a QAHC, or
® a company that has made an entry
notification,
IS, at any later time, a relevant qualifying

Investor in relation to that interest.

© EXpressions used in paragraph (8) have the
same meaning as in Schedule 2 to the
Finance Act 2022 (qualifying asset holding

companies).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the



(118)

public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

es. Charities (stamp duty)

That the following provisions shall have effect
for the period beginning with 22 March 2023
and ending 31 days after the earliest of the
dates mentioned in section 50(2) of the Finance
Act 1973—

@ In Part 1 of Schedule 6 to the Finance Act
2010 (definition of “charity” etc), in
paragraph 2 (jurisdiction condition)—

@ In sub-paragraph (1) omit paragraph (b)
(and the “or” before it);

® Oomit sub-paragraphs (3) to (5).

@ The amendments made by this Resolution—

@ apply only to a body of persons or trust

that has not asserted its status as a



(119)
charity, and

® apply only for the purposes of stamp

duty.

® The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to any instrument

executed on or after 15 March 2023.

@ For the purposes of this Resolution a body
of persons or trust has “asserted its status
as a charity” if—

@ iImmediately before 15 March 2023 it
falls within the definition of “charity” in
Part 1 of Schedule 6 to the Finance
Act 2010, and

® at any time before that date, it has
(under any enactment) made a valid
claim to His Majesty’'s Revenue and
Customs in reliance on its status as a

charity.

s The amendments made by this Resolution



(120)

are to be ignored in determining whether a
person who, immediately before 15 March
2023, holds a relevant interest in—

@ a QAHC, or

® a company that has made an entry

notification,

IS, at any later time, a relevant qualifying

investor in relation to that interest.

© EXxpressions used in paragraph (5) have the
same meaning as in Schedule 2 to the
Finance Act 2022 (qualifying asset holding

companies).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of section
50 of the Finance Act 1973.

7. Charities (other taxes)

That provision may be made amending



(121)

paragraph 2 of Schedule 6 to the Finance Act
2010.

es. Community amateur sports clubs

That provision may be made amending section
661A of the Corporation Tax Act 2010.

s0. Homes for Ukraine Sponsorship scheme

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made for relief from
taxation in relation to the scheme contained in
paragraphs UKR 11.1 to UKR 20.2 of Appendix

Ukraine Scheme to the immigration rules.

70.  Office of Tax Simplification

That provision may be made abolishing the Office

of Tax Simplification.

7. Dormant assets scheme



(122)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made in relation to
authorised reclaim funds within the meaning of

the dormant assets scheme.

2. International arrangements for exchanging

information

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
In the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made—

@ re-enacting (with modifications) section
222 of the Finance Act 2013, section
122 of the Finance Act 2015, section 84
of the Finance Act 2019 and section
129 of the Finance Act 2021 (which
concern international arrangements for

exchanging information), and

® for enabling effect to be given to other

International arrangements for the



(123)

exchange of information.

3. Payment of unclaimed money in court into the

Consolidated Fund

That provision may be made amending section
38 of the Administration of Justice Act 1982 to
enable rules to make provision requiring
unclaimed money in court to be paid into the

Consolidated Fund.

7a.  Financial sanctions regulations

That provision may be made in relation to
payments which are made by His Majesty’s
Revenue and Customs under any enactment to
or for the benefit of persons who are, as a result
of provision made by or under financial
sanctions regulations made under section 1 of
the Sanctions and Anti-Money Laundering Act

2018, designated persons.



(124)

5. Incidental or consequential provision

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made which is
Incidental to, or consequential on, provision

authorised by any other Resolution.



(125)

FINANCE (MONEY): King's recommendation

signified

That, for the purposes of any Act of the present

Session relating to finance, it is expedient to

authorise the payment out of money provided by

Parliament of—

(@)

(b)

any expenditure incurred by the
Commissioners for His Majesty’s
Revenue and Customs which is
attributable to provision made In
relation to Chapter 6A of Part 3 of the
Corporation Tax Act 2009,

any expenditure incurred by the
Commissioners for His Majesty’s
Revenue and Customs which is
attributable to provision made In
relation to net pay arrangements for

pensions in cases where there is no



(©)

(d)

()

(126)
liability to income tax,
any expenditure incurred by virtue of
the Act by the Secretary of State in
connection with import duty,
any expenditure incurred by virtue of
the Act by the Secretary of State in
connection with HGV road user levy,
and
any expenditure incurred by virtue of
the Act by a Minister of the Crown
which is attributable to provision made
by reference to financial sanctions
regulations made under section 1 of the
Sanctions and Anti-Money Laundering
Act 2018.



	“225BA Deferred payments on disposals in connection with divorce   etc
	“36A   Determining levy rate for flavour  concentrates
	1
	N
	“88A    HGV road user levy: transitional provision for end of exempt period

	L  x M
	“Exception from section 101 of the Finance Act 2009 - late payment  interest



